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Freedom of Information Request FOI 25 47

Animals in fire and rescue incidences

Query:

I would like to request a spreadsheet showing data statistics from the past 6 years ( data so
far from the year 2024, and data from 2023, 2022, 2021, 2020, 2019) on the following:

1) Number of incidents the Fire and Rescue service has been called out to regarding
animals welfare each month across the years (incidents involving any type of animal or pet)

2) How many of the animal related incidences were successful in saving/rescuing the
animals involved?

3) What animals/pets are the Fire and Rescue service dealing with across the years?

4) How many of these incidences have involved multiple animals at one time on a particular
call out?

5) A ranking of numbers from each year showing the types of animals which have had
incidences/ fire and rescue call outs to it. (From this | should be able to see the animal type
involved in the most incidences, and the animal species involved the least amount of times
in a fire and rescue incident)

Response:

Q1. Please see attached spreadsheet. We only record if the animal was livestock,
domestic or wild

Q2. We do not record this information.

Q3. We do not record this information.

Q4. We do not record this information.

Q5. Please see attached spreadsheet. (line 30 to line 50)

Information/Detail accurate on the date provided: 09, May 2025
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