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Query 
 
Please can I request some information regarding your energy supply contracts under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please would you provide me with the following 
information: 
 

1. Who, in your organisation, is responsible for deciding how your energy is bought. 

Please provide the full name, title, email address and telephone number. 

 

2. For each of these commodities, electricity, gas and water, please can you answer the 

following questions: 

 

i. What is your current contract term. Start date (DD/MM/YYYY) to end 

date (DD/MM/YYYY)? 

ii. Do you have any options to extend, if so, what are they? 

iii. What is your termination notice period? 

iv. Who is your supplier? 

v. How many meters do you have? 

vi. What is your annual spend? 

vii. What is your consumption? 

viii. Do you currently procure your energy through a framework/PBO 

(Public Buying Organisation)? If so, which one? 

ix. Do you use a consultancy to facilitate your energy procurement, if so, 

who? 

x. Are you happy with your supplier? 

xi. Are you happy with your PBO? 

xii. Are you happy with your consultancy? 

xiii. What do you think makes a good Supplier? 

xiv. What do you think makes a good PBO? 

 
 
Response: 
 

1. Who, in your organisation, is responsible for deciding how your energy is bought. 

Please provide the full name, title, email address and telephone number. 

 
Sue Harries, Estates Manager, sue.harries@dwfire.org.uk, 01722 691379 

 
2. What is your current contract term. Start date (DD/MM/YYYY) to end date 

(DD/MM/YYYY)? 
 

We operate under a rolling contract       
                  
Do you have any options to extend, if so, what are they? 
 
n/a 
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What is your termination notice period? 
 
n/a 
 
Who is your supplier? 
 
Our electricity is supplied by Npower and our gas is supplied by Corona 
 
How many meters do you have? 

 
6 HH electricity meter points 
67 non HH electricity meter points 
34 gas meter points 

 
What is your annual spend? 

 
Based on March 2016 – March 2017: electricity – £166,078.65, gas - £43,473.13 

 
What is your consumption? 
 
This information is not held 
 
Do you currently procure your energy through a framework/PBO (Public Buying 
Organisation)? If so, which one? 
 
Yes, we use YPO for gas and electricity 
 
Do you use a consultancy to facilitate your energy procurement, if so, who? 
 
No 
 
Information is not held for questions 2 X - XIV 

 


